CITY OF WILLIAMSPORT, PA

RESOLUTION

RESOLUTION #

BEb

TITLE

DATE _ S \\—\9

A RESOLUTION AWARDING THE AGGREGATE BIDS FOR THE CITY OF WILLIAMSPORT

BE IT HEREBY RESOLVED BY THE CITY COUNCIIL. OF THE CITY OF WILLIAMSPORT that the contract for
Aggregates for the City of Williamsport be awarded to the following vendors for the items listed below begmning April 1,

2019 and ending March 31, 2020.

VENDOR/DESCRIPTION

HANSON AGGREGATES PENNSYLVANIA LLC
P. O. Box 159, Montoursville, PA 17754

Antiskid (Type AS-3)

APPROXIMATE
UANTITY

Delivered-Job Site or City Stockpile

Antiskid (Type AS-3) FOB Plant
2A Subbase Delivered-Job Site or City Stockpile
2A Subbase FOB Plant

#57 Coarse Aggregate Delivered-Job Site or City Stockpile

{Washed Limestone)

GLENN 0. HAWBAKER, INC.
1952 Waddle Road, Suite 203, State College, PA 16803

#10 Screening FOB Plant
#57 Coarse Aggregate FOB Plant
{Washed Limestone)
R-4 Rock FOB Plant
R-4 Rock Delivered-Job Site or City Stockpile
HEI-WAY LLC

290 North Pike Road, Sarver, PA 16055

High Performance
Cold Patch Material FOB Plant

Quantities listed are estimates and may vary on any item.

City Clerk

Delivered-Job Site or City Stockpile

Approved

500 Tons
500 Tons
1,000 Tons
1,000 Tons
560 Tons

50 Tons
500 Tons

500 Tons
500 Tons

200 Tons
200 Tons

UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
$19.00/Ton $9,500.00
$15.00/Ton $7,500.00
$14.30/Ton $14,300.00

$9.30/Ton $9,300.00
$17.75/Ton $8.875.00
$6.00/Ton $300.00
$12.25/Ton $6,125.00
$13.50/Ton $6,750.00
$17.50/Ton $8,750.00
$110.00/Ton $22,000.00
$100.00/Ton $20,000.00
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2019 SUPPLY BIDS 4/1/19-3/31/20
WEST BRANCH COUNCIL OF GOVERNMENTS CITY OF WILLIAMSPORT RESOLUTION #8765
BID TABULATION
PER TON PRICE

DELIVERED
TO PW BLDG.
OR JOB SITE

HIGH PERFORMANCE COLD PATCH '
Hei-Way LLC (22 ton for minimum delivery) $110.00
HRI, Inc. No Bid
Glenn O. Hawbhaker, Inc. 5130.00 No Bid
Lola Lumber Company Inc. $118.00 No Bid
Pikes Creek Asphalt & Crushed Stone $119.00 5132.00
ANTISKID (TYPE AS-2)
Hanson Aggregates PA LLC No Bid No Bid
Glenn 0. Hawbaker, Inc. No Bid No Bid
Pikes Creek Asphalt & Crushed Stone No Bid No Bid
ANTISKID (TYPE AS-3)
Hanson Aggregates PALLC $15.00
Glenn O. Hawbaker, Inc. No Bid
Pikes Creek Asphalt & Crushed Stone No Bid No Bid
2A SUBBASE (Limestone)
Hanson Aggregates PA LLC $14.30
Glenn Q. Hawbaker, Inc. No Bid No Bid
Pikes Creek Asphalt & Crushed Stone No Bid No Bid
#57 COARSE AGGREGATE (WASHED LIMESTONE)
Hanson Aggregates PA LLC $12.75 $17.75
Glenn 0. Hawbaker, Inc. 54 No Bid
Pikes Creek Asphalt & Crushed Stone No Bid
#10 Screening
Hanson Aggregates PA LLC $9.00 $14.00
Glenn Q. Hawbaker, Inc. No Bid
Pikes Creek Asphalt & Crushed Stone No Bid No Bid
#8 Coarse Aggregate {Limestone) Type A
Hanson Aggregates PA LLC No Bid No Bid
Glenn O. Hawbaker, Inc. No Bid No Bid
Pikes Creek Asphalt & Crushed Stone No Bid No Bid
R-4 ROCK
Hanson Aggretates PA LLC No Bid No Bid



Glenn O. Hawbaker, Inc. 81350 $17.50
Pikes Creek Asphalt & Crushed Stone No Bid No Bid



CITY OF WILLIAMSPORT
DEPARTMENT OF STREETS, PARKS & FLOOD CONTROL

MEMO

To: Mayor Gabriel J. Campana and Members of City Council
From: Adam L. Winder

Subject: Purchase of Aggregates

Date: March 25, 2019

Attached for your review and approval is a resolution authorizing the City of Williamsport to
purchase aggregate supplies through the West Branch COG Aggregate Cooperative Purchasing
Contract for the period of April 1, 2019 through March 31, 2020.

The resolution identifies the low bidding vendor for each of the specified materials used by the
City of Williamsport, quantities are estimates only. Purchase of the aggregate supplies is funded
through Liquid Fuels 7001-62190, Street Materials and 7001-62080, Salt and Cinders for the
Antiskid.

I am requesting that action be taken by City Council on Thursday, Aprif 11, 2019.

AT W/

Attachments



